
Seller: How to set up your online store

Step 1: Get your unique store link

Step 3: Track your progress

Step 2: Share your store link

There are two ways to get your store link:

1. Group Leader Registration: Your store 
link will be emailed to you by your group 
leader.

OR

2. Self-Registration: A self-registration 
link will be emailed to you by your group 
leader. Fill out the required information 
and your unique store link will be emailed 
to you. 

Click on the icons to  share your 
customized message on various social 
media platforms.

Tip: Post your message across multiple 
channels and networks to ensure more 
people will see it. Make sure you include 
what you are raising money for!

Click on See Supporters to view your seller 
stats and see how much you’ve sold. 
Challenge your friends to see who can 
reach their goals first!

Tip: Send a thank you note to your supporters.

At the end of your fundraiser, you will 
receive a Seller Report. The document lists 
your supporters’ contact information and 
products  they ordered, so you can deliver 
their orders as quickly as possible.
Tip: CLICK HERE to watch a short video
on how to sell more using your online
store!

Step 4: Deliver your orders
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https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=H6zVJzjHVkc&t=6s

